Re: Change Date #203932

From Marie Dalton <mariedalton14@gmail.com>
To <howie@rooms101.com>
Date 2022-06-09 09:28

Hello | see the payment didn't post. Can you take 200 today and I'll call next week for the 190 and the regular amount in two
weeks???

On Tue, Mar 22,2022, 4:20 PM Marie Dalton <mariedalton14@gmail.com> wrote:
It's stating invalid email address

On Tue, Mar 22, 2022, 2:54 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:
Marie,

It is always in your document center. Go to
https://clientrts2.rooms101.com. Invoice number:203932

Customer Care

On 2022-03-22 10:13, Marie Dalton wrote:

> Is it possible to send the new contract again??

>

>0n Tue, Mar 15,2022, 12:54 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

>

>> sent new invoice to sign for new payment plan please look over if

>> not

>> correct call or email us

>>

>> 0n 2022-03-14 16:44, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>> The date | want the the payment to start is May 15th.

>>>

>>>0n Fri, Mar 11, 2022, 1:35 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

>>>

>>>> we have been trying to get a hold of you about the payment please
>>>> call

>>>>us at 800 870 6691 of email us the date you want us to run the
>>>> credit

>>>> card

>>>>

>>>> Customer Care

>>>>

>>>>0n 2022-03-02 10:04, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>>>> | would like to do double payments and split them up to come out
>>>> twice

>>>>>a month. June of this year right? Also can | make extra payments
>>>> 10

>>>>> make sure it's done.

>>>>>

>>>>>0n Wed, Mar 2, 2022, 1:52 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:




>>>>>

>>>>>> you tell me what you want to do on the payment we can change
>>any

>>>> of

>>>>>> the

>>>>>> as long you are paid by 6/4

>>>5>>>

>>>>>> 0n 2022-03-02 08:17, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>>>>>> Hello for the payment that's coming up on Friday | need to

>> know

>>>> if

>>>>>> |

>>>>>>> can divide that into 2 payments or change the payment due date
>>>> {0

>>>>>> the

>>>>>>> need of the month??? Can you please tell me if the date can be
>>>>>> moved

>>>>>>>to May or June??

>>5>5>>5>>

>>>>>>> 0n Wed, Dec 8, 2021, 11:44 AM Marie Dalton

>>>>>> <mariedalton14@gmail.com>

>>>>>>> Wrote:

>5>5>>5>>

>>>>>>>> Will do, thanks!

S>5>5>>5>>>

>>>>>>>> 0n Wed, Dec 8, 2021, 11:00 AM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:
S5>5>5>5>5>>

>>>>>>>>>make sure you sign the new invoice

SS5>5>5>5>>>

>>>>>>>>> 0n 2021-12-08 06:27, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>>>>>>>>> Great, thanks!

SE>>>55>>>>

>>>>>>>>>> 0n Wed, Dec 8, 2021, 10:22 AM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:
SOS>5>5>>>>

>>>>>>>>>>> yes | will make the final payment 4-2022

SS5555>5>5>5>>

>>>>>>>>>>> 0n 2021-12-08 06:19, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>>>>>>>>>>> G0ood morning is it possible to skip the payment for
>>>>>>>>>12/10/202177?

SSS5555>55>5>>

>>>>>>>>>>>> 0n Wed, Dec 8, 2021, 10:16 AM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:
SSS>>55>5>5>5>>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>> make the change and sent new invoice

SSS555555>5>>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>0n 2021-12-07 07:17, Marie Dalton wrote:
>>>>>>>>>>>>>> Keep the three. Thanks

SSS55555555>55>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 0n Tue, Dec 7, 2021, 10:49 AM <howie@rooms101.com>
>> wrote:

SEEEE555555>>>




>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> we can make the change but the new price is 2214.49
>>you

>>>>>> are

>>>>>>>>> N

>>>>5>>>>>> g

SS55555555>55> 3

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> bedroom now. did you want to change to a 2 bedroom if
>>>> the

>>>>>>>>> price

SOSS555>5>5>5>5>> iS

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 1941 .25

SOSS335>35>55>5>>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 0n 2021-12-06 16:40, Marie Dalton wrote:
>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> | need to change the date again. Denise just can't

>> make

>>5>5>>> up

>>>>>>>>> her

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> mind.

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> December 24th to January 2nd. Want to still stay at
>>>> Lake

>>>>>>>>> Buena

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> \ista 2

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> bedrooms. Need to change payment date until March
>>2022.

SSSS553>3>5>5>3>5>5>5>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 0n Mon, Oct 11, 2021, 10:08 AM <howie@rooms101.com>
>>>>>> wrote:

SOSS35333>53>3>3>>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> Where are we going what are you looking for and how
>>>> many

>>>>>>>>>>> people

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> glre

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> traveling

SOSSOS>53>555>5>>>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 0n 2021-10-09 07:26, Marie Dalton wrote:
>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> Hello | was wondering if it could change my dates
>> 10

>>>>>>>>>>> December

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 27th

>S>>>5555>>>>>>>>> {0

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> January 4th???

SSSS555555555>55>>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 0On Thu, Sep 16, 2021, 10:06 AM <howie@rooms101.com>
>>>>>>>>> Wrote:

SSSS5333>3>3>3335>5>>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> you still have a balance left of 563.46. When you
>>>> are

>>>>>>>>> ready

>S>>>>>>>>>>>> 10

SESEO555555335>555>> travel,




>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> please contact our office AT
>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 1-800-749-4045 and choose option 1 for new sales
>>and

>>>>>>>>> they

>>>>5>>>>>>>> Will

SS>>555>>5>>>>> he

SOSS555535553>555>5>5>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> happy >> to re-book your travel.
SSS5555535553555>5>5>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 0n 2021-09-15 06:16, Marie Dalton wrote:
>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> Do you know how much more it will be?
SOSS55>555>5>553>55>5>55>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 0n Wed, Sep 15, 2021, 10:05 AM

>> <howie@rooms101.com>

>>>>>>>>> Wrote:

SSSS555553553555>55>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> Per your request we have changed your current
>>>>>>>>>>> reservations

>S>>>>>>>>>>>> {0

S>>>3333>>>>>>>>> an

SOSS55>55>3353>5555555> Open

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> package. Please reply to this emailed that you
>>>>>>>>> ggreed.

SSSS555533553553555>5>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> \When you are ready to travel, please contact our
>>>>>>>>> office

>>>>>>>>>>> AT

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 1-800-749-4045 and choose option 1 for new sales
>>>> and

>>>>>>>>> they

>>>>5>>>>>>>>>> Will

SOS>55>55>5>55>5>55>> be

SSSS555555553553555>> happy

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> t0 re-book your travel.
SS55535535553>555555>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> All monies paid to date will be applied to the
>> new

>>>>>>>>>>> package.

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> Please reply to this email that you agree with
>>the

SS5>>5>5>5>> Change

>S>S>>5>5>>>>>>> 10

SSS>5355355>5555>> Open

SSSS555535553553555>> paCkage,

SOSS5333353333>535>55>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> Thank you.

SOSS535533333355555>5>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> Customer Care at Rooms101.com
SSS5553555553>553555>>

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 0n 2021-09-14 10:43, Marie Dalton wrote:




>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> Open package can you leave my dates open so |
>> can

>>>>>>>>>>>>> reschedule

SS555555>555>>>>>> for

SSSS>>>5555>>>>>>>>>> June

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 18th thru June 25th? | will call in January for
>>>>>>>>> pricing

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> please

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> continue my payment plan.




