Re: Change Date #203932

From Marie Dalton <mariedalton14@gmail.com>
To <howie@rooms101.com>
Date 2022-09-28 07:08

Please take 211 today. Let me know when you are going to run it so | can unlock the card.

On Fri, Sep 23,2022, 10:39 AM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:
Went can we take the balance of the payment

On 2022-09-16 07:04, Marie Dalton wrote:

> Next week I'll send you a msg to take the rest of the money. And then
> the next one will be the correct amount to take on Friday.

>

> On Fri, Sep 16,2022, 10:51 AM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

>

>> When are you planning making the rest of the payment. The 100 did
>> clear

>>today.

>>

>>0n 2022-09-16 06:44, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>> |'m unlocking the card right now can you take 100 dollars

>>>

>>>0n Thu, Sep 8, 2022, 1:06 PM Marie Dalton

>> <mariedalton14@gmail.com>

>>> wrote:

>>>

>>>> Will do, thank you.

>>>>

>>>>0n Thuy, Sep 8, 2022, 11:52 AM <howie@rooms1071.com> wrote:

>>>>

>>>>> ok we will make the change please make sure the money is there
>>>>>

>>>>> 0n 2022-09-08 07:13, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>>>>> | put the wrong dates for my pay period so | don't get paid
>>>>> until next

>>>>>> Friday so can we change it to that. I'm sorry for all the
>>>>>> jnconvenience.

>>>>>>

>>>>>>0n Mon, Jul 11, 2022, 1:28 PM Marie Dalton

>>>>> <mariedalton14@gmail.com>

>>>>>> wrote:

>>5>>>>

>>>>>>> 0k, thank you.

>S>5>555>>

>>>>>>>0n Mon, Jul 11,2022, 1:18 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

SS5>5>5>>

>>>>>>>> | will change the payments and sent new invoice to sign but
>>>>>>>> remember if

>>>>>>>> 7 payment declined and you will need to paid the reservation
>>>>> in

>>>>>>>> fyll

SS>>5>5>>>

>>>>>>>> 0n 2022-07-11 08:24, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>>>>>>>> Ok so let's skip August and split the payment in 6 ways.
SSS>>5>>>>

>>>>>>>>> September 7th and 21st $211.00

>>>>>>>>> October 5th and 19th $211.00

>>>>>>>>> November 2nd and 16th 211.00




