
Fwd: Paperwork
From TANISHA WIMBER <nishie11@gmail.com>
To <custcare@rooms101.com>
Date 2022-05-10 07:37

my invoice number is 205006 maurice and tanisha Wimber 
Please cancel my trip for june 12-June 15. 

This is due to you not having the accommodations that i signed up for. Thanks Tanisha 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <custcare@rooms101travel.com>

Date: Fri, Mar 25, 2022 at 10:57 AM

Subject: Paperwork

To: <nishie11@gmail.com>


 

 

Dear Tanisha, 

Contacting you to let you know that your paperwork is ready to sign off on you will
need to login.

Please use https://clientrts2.rooms101.com/ 

Your email and Invoice Number 205006 are used to login.

Top Destinations

Lake Buena Vista
Kissimmee
Orlando
Branson
Myrtle Beach
Charleston
Gatlinburg
Las Vegas
Hilton Head
Lake Tahoe
Costa Rica
Poconos
 
 

Important Notice

Please verify the information that has been
given to us so that we may proceed with your
final confirmation.


Do not travel without your final confirmation in
your possession.


If you have not received your final confirmation
via email approximately 72 hours before your
departure date contact customer care 
immediately before you depart on your vacation
at 1-800-870-6691.
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Have a great time on your trip.
 

Purpose of this email is to confirm travel arrangements.


