
Re: Covid client
From Branson Reservations Center <bransonreservations@centurytel.net>
To Rooms101 <reservations@rooms101.com>
Reply-To John Jardine <bransonreservations@centurytel.net>
Date 22/06/2022 08:35

Yes. No charge for the room.


----- Original Message -----

From: "Rooms101" <reservations@rooms101.com>

To: "bransonreservations@centurytel.net" <bransonreservations@centurytel.net>

Sent: Wednesday, June 22, 2022 9:11:37 AM

Subject: Re: Covid client


John,


Have you heard back from the hotel?  Is there a charge?


Michele


On 21/06/2022 07:41, Branson Reservations Center wrote:

Mr. & Mrs. Robinson canceled do to coved.

----- Original Message -----

From: "Rooms101" <reservations@rooms101.com>

To: "bransonreservations@centurytel.net"

<bransonreservations@centurytel.net>, "eagles@centurytel.net"

<eagles@centurytel.net>

Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2022 10:40:29 AM

Subject: Covid client



John,



Here you go
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