Re: Cancellation of reservation 205714

From Danielle Johnson <daniniichelmsw@gmail.com>
To <howie@rooms101.com>
Date 2022-09-12 06:14

| agree. Yes. Please refund. | understand the $50. Please refund the rest

On Mon, Sep 12,2022 at 7:13 AM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:
Per your request we have cancelled your current reservations.

Any Question please contact our office AT 1-800-870-6691.
Remember there is a $50.00 cancellation fee.
Please reply to this email that you agree to the cancellation.

Thank you.
Customer Care at Rooms101.com

Danielle Johnson




