
RE: CHANGE - NEW RESV -12/30/2022- Naveed, Humaira URGENT PLEASE 2Rooms
From <krystalminivac@kivc.com>
To <reservations@rooms101.com>
Date 27/12/2022 05:48

 KIVC Invoice-NAVEED-DEC 30 - JAN 3.xlsx(~11 KB)

Ok confirmed 618889-1/2. Billing is attached. Thank you.


 

Monica Ross

Krystal Cancun Mini Vac Dept.

52-998-848-9800 ext 828


-----Mensaje original-----

De: reservations@rooms101.com [mailto:reservations@rooms101.com] 

Enviado el: martes, 27 de diciembre de 2022 09:43 a. m.

Para: krystalminivac@kivc.com

Asunto: Re: CHANGE - NEW RESV -12/30/2022- Naveed, Humaira URGENT PLEASE

2Rooms


Yes, please book both rooms.  It is 2 adults in 1 room and 2 adults and a

kid in 2nd room.  MBA will pay the $600.00 please send us an invoice. 

Please send confirm when booked


thanks

Michele


On 27/12/2022 05:19, krystalminivac@kivc.com wrote:

I am able to do this 2nd room but please confirm that they 100% want 

it before I move everything around please. The cost is $600 usd if its 

just 2 adults or 2 adults and 2 kids + the resort fee.  Thank you.



-----Mensaje original-----

De: reservations@rooms101.com [mailto:reservations@rooms101.com]

Enviado el: lunes, 26 de diciembre de 2022 03:54 p. m.

Para: krystalminivac@kivc.com

Asunto: CHANGE - NEW RESV -12/30/2022- Naveed, Humaira URGENT PLEASE 

2Rooms



This client stated that she has spoken with Krystal rep and she is now 

adding a 2nd room.  MBA will pay for the 2nd room.



Michele



On 26/12/2022 09:06, reservations@rooms101.com wrote:

oops  sorry  585-802-3400



Michele



On 26/12/2022 09:02, krystalminivac@kivc.com wrote:

We also need the pone #



-----Mensaje original-----

De: reservations@rooms101.com [mailto:reservations@rooms101.com]

Enviado el: lunes, 26 de diciembre de 2022 10:09 a. m.

Para: Krystal-Monica Ross

Asunto: RESEND: NEW RESV -12/30/2022- Naveed, Humaira URGENT PLEASE

Importancia: Alta





Monica,



Sorry here is the correct email:  humaira.naveed@xerox.com



Michele

-------- Original Message --------

Subject: NEW RESV -12/30/2022- Naveed, Humaira      URGENT PLEASE

Date: 26/12/2022 05:50

 From: reservations@rooms101.com

To: Krystal-Monica Ross <krystalminivac@kivc.com>
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