
Re: CANCEL - 1/20/2023 Haynes, Melissa 2BdrCabin
From Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>
To <reservations@rooms101.com>
Cc Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>, <MBA@GOTOEPM.COM>
Date 11/01/2023 07:28

The res has been cxled. 


Thanks,

Adam Lawson

Reservations Manager

Eagle Property Management, Inc.

865-868-6028

Www.eaglesridge.com

Www.myheritagecabin.com


On Jan 11, 2023, at 10:33 AM, reservations@rooms101.com wrote:



﻿Please cancel this reservation.



Thanks

Michele




On 09/01/2023 06:26, Adam Lawson wrote:

Here you go!

Melissa Haynes - RES# 106690 - ER 79 (2 bedroom cabin) - 01/20 for 2

nights - total to be charged = $268.00

Have a good week!

Thanks,

Adam Lawson

Reservations Manager

Eagle Property Management, Inc.

865-868-6028

Www.eaglesridge.com

Www.myheritagecabin.com

On Jan 9, 2023, at 9:46 AM, reservations@rooms101.com wrote:

﻿Good morning,

Please book this cabin.  I don't know if Margo spoke with you or not.

Thanks

Michele

http://www.eaglesridge.com/
http://www.myheritagecabin.com/
mailto:reservations@rooms101.com
http://www.eaglesridge.com/
http://www.myheritagecabin.com/
mailto:reservations@rooms101.com

