Fwd: Rooms

From Phillip Jones <pljonesdvfd11@gmail.com>
To <howie@rooms101.com>
Date 2023-04-1219:08
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Howie if | give you my card number for invoice id 206285 can you wait to run friday morning because the money will be there then. | borrowed from my retirement to
pay this and they got it processed later and it will be friday. Lindsey Potts is my cousin and we will be staying in the cabin together and this trip is important to us all
do to the fact it may be my mother-in-law's last vacation do to her terminal cancer and she wants to renew her vows with my father in law before there 50 years
because she doesn't think she will make it. Please email me back and | will send you the card number or if you have questions you can call me at 8126618110 my
name is Phil Jones

- Forwarded message —-——-

From: Phillip Jones <pljonesdvfd11@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, Apr 12, 2023, 22:59

Subject: Rooms

To: <howie@rooms.com>

Howie if | give you my card number can you run it on Friday morning to take care of balance for Lindsey Potts | will have the money Friday morning. Invoice I'd
206285
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