Re: CANCEL - #83 cabin 02/24 2 nights sterling bryant URGENT

From Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>

To <reservations@rooms101.com>

Cc Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>, <MBA@GOTOEPM.COM>
Date 24/02/2023 15:57

I’m sorry but at this point it is non refundable.

Thanks,

Adam Lawson

Reservations Manager

Eagle Property Management, Inc.
865-868-6028

Www.eaglesridge.com

Www.myheritagecabin.com

On Feb 24, 2023, at 4:06 PM, reservations@rooms191.com wrote:

Adam,

I am not sure if you spoke with this client but they are unable to travel as the wife (I think) has COVID. They are sending us proof which
I will forward as soon as I get it but wanted you to know asap

Is there anything we can do?

Michele

On 24/01/2023 ©09:30, Adam Lawson wrote:
Here you go!

STERLING BRYANT - RES# 107750 - ER 83 (2 BEDROOM CABIN) - ©2/24 FOR 2
NIGHTS - TOTAL TO BE CHARGED = $268.00
Thanks,

Adam Lawson

Reservations Manager

Eagle Property Management, Inc.
865-868-6028

Www.eaglesridge.com

Www.myheritagecabin.com

On Jan 24, 2023, at 1:13 PM, Margo Weingarten <margo.weingarten@gmail.com> wrote:
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