Re: Pigeon forge
From pottslindsey1985 <pottslindsey1985@gmail.com>

To <howie@rooms101.com>
Date 2023-03-23 07:07

Can we pull rhe payment on the 4 bedroom on the 28th instead of the 27th . My husband gets paid that day

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

—— Original message ——

From: howie@rooms101.com

Date: 3/14/23 10:03 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: pottslindsey1985 <pottslindsey1985@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Pigeon forge

yes thats correct

On 2023-03-13 06:25, pottslindsey1985 wrote:
> And the whole 700 that was already paid goes on the 2 3 bedrooms snd
> the one bedroom

>

> Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

> Original message ——

> From: howie@rooms101.com

> Date: 3/13/23 9:11 AM (GMT-06:00)

> To: pottslindsey1985 <pottslindsey1985@gmail.com>

> Subject: Re: Pigeon forge

>

> on the one sale with 2 3 bedrooms and 1 bedroom the balance is 3769.00
>

>good until 4/10

>

> on the one sale with 1 4 bedrooms the balance is 1666.00 good until
>3/27

>

>0n 2023-03-12 20:37, pottslindsey1985 wrote:

>> Hey how much do | owe yet on the cabins and when is the last day |
>> have to pay it ? Not including makaylas cabin .

>>

>> Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

>>

>> ——— QOriginal message ——--

>> From: howie@rooms101.com

>> Date: 3/2/23 2:20 PM (GMT-05:00)

>> To: pottslindsey1985 <pottslindsey1985@gmail.com>

>> Subject: Re: Pigeon forge

>>

>> made the change and sent new invoice please sign

>>

>> 0n 2023-03-02 09:03, pottslindsey1985 wrote:

>>>They would like cabin 222. No just the 3rd through the 7th
>>>

>>> Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

>>>

>>> -——- Original message ——-

>>> From: howie@rooms101.com



