Re: RESEND: 9/18/2023 Solomon, Shirley - 2Bdr Cabin 83

From Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>

To <reservations@rooms101.com>

Cc Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>, <MBA@GOTOEPM.COM>
Date 17/04/2023 08:53

ER-solomon.pdf (~3 KB)

Here you go!
SHIRLEY SOLOMON - RES# 112475 - ER 83 (2 BEDROOM CABIN) - ©9/18 FOR 6 NIGHTS - TOTAL TO BE CHARGED = $784.00

Thanks,

Adam Lawson

Reservations Manager

Eagle Property Management, Inc.
865-868-6028

Www.eaglesridge.com

Www.myheritagecabin.com

On Apr 17, 2023, at 9:49 AM, reservations@rooms101.com wrote:

Still need confirmation on this cabin.

———————— Original Message --------

Subject: 9/18/2023 Solomon, Shirley - 2Bdr Cabin 83
Date: 14/04/2023 10:56

From: reservations@rooms101.com

To: Eagles Ridge <adam.l@gotoepm.com>, Eagles Ridge <MBA@gotoepm.com>

Adam,

Please book this cabin. Margo already called you on it.

Thanks
Michele
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