Re: Resort fees statement

From Jennifer Morris <ellsworth4230@gmail.com>
To reservations@rooms101.com <reservations@rooms101.com>

Date 04/05/2023 03:08

Yes

On Wednesday, May 3, 2023, <reservations@rooms101.com> wrote:
There was no receipt attached for the resort fees. The agreement is that we will pay half of the fees.

Please send the receipt and this is for Connie Halstead correct.

On 02/05/2023 15:08, Jennifer Morris wrote:
| was promised resort fees would be taken care of. They told me to
send over the receipt. This is for 1 day so that would be x3!! They
said they couldn't print out all 3 because we've only been here 1
day... but this is the price per day. Please let me know when they are
taken care of. Thank you
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