Re: CANCEL - 5/18/2023 Lewis, Sharon 2Bdr Cabin

From Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>

To <reservations@rooms101.com>

Cc Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>, <MBA@GOTOEPM.COM>
Date 01/05/2023 11:50

The res has been cxled.

Thanks,

Adam Lawson

Reservations Manager

Eagle Property Management, Inc.
865-868-6028

Www.eaglesridge.com

Www.myheritagecabin.com

On May 1, 2023, at 3:35 PM, reservations@roomsl1@l.com wrote:

Please cancel this cabin.

Thanks
Michele

On 28/04/2023 06:12, Adam Lawson wrote:

Here you go!

SHARON LEWIS - RES# 112906 - ER 251 (2 BEDROOM CABIN) - ©5/18 FOR 2 NIGHTS - TOTAL TO BE CHARGED = $268.00
Thanks,

Adam Lawson

Reservations Manager

Eagle Property Management, Inc.

865-868-6028

Www.eaglesridge.com

Www.myheritagecabin.com

On Apr 28, 2023, at 9:41 AM, reservations@rooms1@l.com wrote:

Adam,

Good morning. I'd not sure if Margo called you on this. Please book this cabin.
Thanks

Michele
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