Re: Re; Zalajah abdulrabrasool refund my money

From nargis tamanna <nyc6706@gmail.com>
To <reservations@rooms101.com>
Date 2024-09-18 14:51

Yes it’s my chase visa bank card 4207670285555978

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 18, 2024, at 11:40 AM, reservations@rooms101l.com wrote:

Please verify if the card ending in 5978 is still valid.

Thank You
Customer Care
Rooms101.com

On 2024-09-16 11:56, nargis tamanna wrote:
Please note that I Zalajah abdulrabrasool can’t make any reservations do to my healthso I need the amount to be credited back to my card.

Please call me at (929)385-8564 regarding my refund or if you have any questions thank you.




