Re: Cancellation

From carlene bowden <cybowden@yahoo.com>
To <howie@rooms101.com>
Date 2024-06-25 06:22

Good morning,

I understand the 50.00 fee. Please add it to the other room.
Thank you

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 25, 2024, at 10:10 AM, howie@rooms101.com wrote:

Ms. Bowden you know there is a $50.00 cancellation fee, and do you want us to apply the payment of $614.88 towards the other room
reservation.

If so just reply to this email to go ahead and do that.

Thank You
Customer care
Rooms101.com

On 2024-06-24 11:26, carlene bowden wrote:
Good afternoon.
6-24-2024
Im writing in reference to Invoice 207649 Carlene Bowden. I reserved 2
4 bdrm units. I would like to cancel 1 of the 4 bdrm units.
Thank you
Carlene Bowden




