Re: Earnestine McGrew

From Earnestine Mcgrew <earnestine.mcgrew@yahoo.com>
To <howie@rooms101.com>
Date 2022-04-04 08:42

How was the total 4645.42 when we had all for cabins and now it's 5897. That's kind of crazy

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Monday, April 4,2022, 11:28 AM, howie@rooms101.com wrote:

| have cancel the cabin 204, your new price is 5897.00. | have adjusted
the final payment and when my computer is fixed i will sent a new
invoice to you

On 2022-04-04 07:58, Earnestine Mcgrew wrote:
> That why | said we can cancel cabin 204

>

> Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone [1]

>

> 0On Monday, April 4,2022, 10:56 AM, Earnestine Mcgrew

> <earnestine.mcgrew@yahoo.com> wrote:

>

>> 16 | still need 3 2 bedroom 2 bath cabins | don't need the 4th
>>one

>>

>> Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone [1]

>>

>> On Monday, April 4,2022, 10:25 AM, howie@rooms101.com wrote:
>> How many people are in the party to travel now.

>>

>> 0n 2022-04-02 14:29, Earnestine Mcgrew wrote:

>>> Hello | am reaching out because one of the couples that were
>> suppose

>>>t0 come on this trip has has some things to happen and will not be
>>> able to come. So | want to see if | can cancel only cabin 204 and
>> get

>>> a balance for the remaining 3 cabins. So for any inconvenience
>>>

>>> Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone [1]

>>>

>>>

>>> Links:

>>> [1] https://overview.mail.yahoo.com/?.src=i0S




> [1] https://overview.mail.yahoo.com/?.src=i0S




