Payment for Cabins

From <howie@rooms101.com>
To Earnestine Mcgrew <earnestine.mcgrew@yahoo.com>
Date 2022-05-1011:46

Ernestine,

Ok we have charged the card for the amount requested. Remember the final payment MUST be
made on the 16h.

ALSO, you must sign of on the terms. . Go to https://clientrts2.roomsl10l.com. Your
email and Invoice Number are used to login. Invoice number 204212. We also sent a text
with the info to the terms.

Customer Care

On 2022-05-10 11:09, Earnestine Mcgrew wrote:

Run the amount 1,557.00 today using card ended in 5318 and run the
remaining Monday 16 for remaining using same card

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone [1]

On Tuesday, May 10, 2022, 12:41 PM, howie@rooms1@l.com wrote:

Yes, how much are you paying today and is it the credit card on
file,
which one? Also, the rest MUST be paid on Monday morning!.

On 2022-05-10 07:51, Earnestine Mcgrew wrote:

Someone in does not have all their money can I pay part today and
the
other Monday 16th

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone [1]

On Tuesday, May 10, 2022, 8:30 AM, custcare@roomsl@l.com wrote:

Earnestine, Your cabin reservation are up for cancellation due
to

non

payment and not terms. This MUST be done today. Call
1-800-870-6691
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