Re: Change Date #203932

From Marie Dalton <mariedalton14@gmail.com>
To <howie@rooms101.com>
Date 2022-03-14 16:44

The date | want the the payment to start is May 15th.

On Fri, Mar 11, 2022, 1:35 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:
we have been trying to get a hold of you about the payment please call
us at 800 870 6691 of email us the date you want us to run the credit
card

Customer Care

On 2022-03-02 10:04, Marie Dalton wrote:

> | would like to do double payments and split them up to come out twice
>a month. June of this year right? Also can | make extra payments to
> make sure it's done.

>

>0n Wed, Mar 2, 2022, 1:52 PM <howie@rooms107.com> wrote:

>

>> you tell me what you want to do on the payment we can change any of
>>the

>> as long you are paid by 6/4

>>

>>0n 2022-03-02 08:17, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>> Hello for the payment that's coming up on Friday | need to know if
>> |

>>> can divide that into 2 payments or change the payment due date to
>> the

>>> need of the month??? Can you please tell me if the date can be

>> moved

>>>to May or June??

>>>

>>> 0n Wed, Dec 8, 2021, 11:44 AM Marie Dalton

>> <mariedalton14@gmail.com>

>>> wrote:

>>>

>>>> Will do, thanks!

>>>>

>>>>0n Wed, Dec 8, 2021, 11:00 AM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:
>>>>

>>>>> make sure you sign the new invoice

>>>>>

>>>>>0n 2021-12-08 06:27, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>>>>> Great, thanks!

>S>>>>>

>>>>>> 0n Wed, Dec 8, 2021, 10:22 AM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

>>5>5>>>




