Re: Change Date #203932

From Marie Dalton <mariedalton14@gmail.com>
To <howie@rooms101.com>
Date 2022-06-23 05:15

Good morning you can do a payment for 100 and I'll text you again next week. Thanks

On Thu, Jun 9, 2022, 2:22 PM Marie Dalton <mariedalton14@gmail.com> wrote:
Thank you!

On Thu, Jun 9, 2022, 2:17 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:
ok it has been handle

On 2022-06-09 09:28, Marie Dalton wrote:

> Hello | see the payment didn't post. Can you take 200 today and I'll

> call next week for the 190 and the regular amount in two weeks???

>

> 0On Tue, Mar 22, 2022, 4:20 PM Marie Dalton <mariedalton14@gmail.com>
> wrote:

>

>> |t's stating invalid email address
>>

>>0n Tue, Mar 22, 2022, 2:54 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

>>

>>> Marie,

>>>

>>> [t is always in your document center. Go to

>>> https://clientrts2.rooms1071.com. Invoice number:203932

>>>

>>> Customer Care

>>>

>>>0n 2022-03-22 10:13, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>>> |s it possible to send the new contract again??

>>>>

>>>> 0n Tue, Mar 15, 2022, 12:54 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

>>>>

>>>>> sent new invoice to sign for new payment plan please look over
>>> if

>>>>> not

>>>>> correct call or email us

>>>>>

>>>>> 0n 2022-03-14 16:44, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>>>>> The date | want the the payment to start is May 15th.

>>>>>>

>>>>>> 0n Fri, Mar 11, 2022, 1:35 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

>>>>>>

>>>>>>> we have been trying to get a hold of you about the payment
>>> please

>>>>>>> call

>>>>>>> us at 800 870 6691 of email us the date you want us to run
>>>the

>>>>>>> credit

>>>>>>> card

>S>>>>5>>

>>>>>>> Customer Care

S>>>>5>>

>>>>>>> 0n 2022-03-02 10:04, Marie Dalton wrote:

>>>>>>>> | would like to do double payments and split them up to come
>>> out




