Re: Payment made

From <howie@rooms101.com>
To Marie Dalton <mariedalton14@gmail.com>
Date 2022-10-26 12:02

Ran $153.00 today Just a reminder that the reservation MUST be paid in full on 11/16/2022 or it WILL BE CANCELLED.

On 2022-10-26 10:49, Marie Dalton wrote:

153.00 for today

On Wed, Oct 26, 2022, 2:45 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

952.58 is the balance

On 2022-10-26 06:02, Marie Dalton wrote:

Good morning what's the balance??

On Mon, Oct 24, 2022, 3:02 PM Marie Dalton

<mariedaltonl4@gmail.com>

wrote:

Wednesday

On Mon, Oct 24, 2022, 2:10 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

still have not heard from you

On 2022-10-19 ©5:42, Marie Dalton wrote:

I'll pay something on Friday. Then something again on

Wednesday.

Thanks

On Mon, Oct 17, 2022, 1:54 PM <howie@rooms1@1.com> wrote:

when can we take the payment

On 2022-10-12 07:07, Marie Dalton wrote:

Because of the holiday on Monday I'll text you tomorrow when

get

paid. Sorry for the inconvenience.

On Wed, Oct 12, 2022, 10:32 AM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:

Marie, the card declined for the payment, please email us

went to

take

it out. In the future you email us when to take the payment.

THanks
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