
Re: 6/2/2022 Garrett, Melissa - Book 5 Bedroom home
From rosie reservations <rosie.reservations@gmail.com>
To <reservations@rooms101.com>
Date 27/04/2022 10:28

Perfect thank you Michele and i can confirm booking will be $184 a night plus clean = $1040 - booking is now in
our system

Kind Regards,
Rosie 
Columbus Vacations 

On Wed, Apr 27, 2022 at 2:07 PM <reservations@rooms101.com> wrote:

Rosie,



We know that the cost is incorrect on this.  Please book the home and 

send the cost back.



Thanks

Michele





On 27/04/2022 09:45, rosie reservations wrote:

> Hi,

> 

> Can I please get guests email and departure date? (didn't receive a

> attachment of guests info like usual)

> 

> kind regards,

> Rosie

> Columbus Vacations

> 

> On Wed, Apr 27, 2022 at 1:43 PM rose stack <stack.rose@aol.com> wrote:

> 

>> -----Original Message-----

>> From: Columbus Vacations <columbus@columbus-vacations.com>

>> To: rose stack <stack.rose@aol.com>

>> Sent: Wed, Apr 27, 2022 12:54 pm

>> Subject: Fwd: 6/2/2022 Garrett, Melissa - Book 5 Bedroom home

>> 

>> Can you book please

>> 

>> Kind Regards

>> Laura Prieto

>> 
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>> Sent from my iPhone - please excuse any typing errors !

>> 

>> Begin forwarded message:

>> 

>>> From: reservations@rooms101.com

>>> Date: April 27, 2022 at 12:00:06 PM EDT

>>> To: Columbus Bookings-House ck in

>>> <columbus@columbus-vacations.com>

>>> Subject: 6/2/2022 Garrett, Melissa  - Book 5 Bedroom home

>> 

>> ﻿Please book the 5 bedroom home for Garrett, Melissa   - Cost

>> $1040.00

>> 

>> Thanks Michele

>> 

>> -------- Original Message --------

>> Subject: Re: 6/2/2022 Garrett, Melissa

>> Date: 27/04/2022 06:20

>> From: reservations@rooms101.com

>> To: Columbus Vacations <columbus@columbus-vacations.com>

>> 

>> This was our oversight.  The cost should be $1040.00 correct?

>> 

>> On 27/04/2022 01:49, Columbus Vacations wrote:

>> Hi Michele

>> The cost on this booking isnt correct ?

>> I have attached the contracted rates - please let me know

>> Kind Regards

>> 

>> Laura Prieto

>> 

>> Columbus Vacations

>> Tel : (001) 352 432 2087

>> -----Original Message-----

>> From: reservations@rooms101.com [mailto:reservations@rooms101.com]

>> Sent: Tuesday, April 26, 2022 4:40 PM

>> To: Columbus Bookings-House ck in

>> Subject: 6/2/2022 Garrett, Melissa

>> Importance: High

>> Please book this reservation for 5 Bedroom  Preferred Home.   ALSO,

>> this

>> client is requesting to be allowed to register as soon as possible

>> after

>> 5/19/2022

>> Please confirm back cost.


mailto:reservations@rooms101.com
mailto:columbus@columbus-vacations.com
mailto:reservations@rooms101.com
mailto:columbus@columbus-vacations.com
mailto:reservations@rooms101.com
mailto:reservations@rooms101.com


>> Thanks

>> Michele


