
Re: Tarra Snyder COMPLETED TOUR?
From Linda Mayhugh <linda@gunnmarketinggroup.com>
To <michele@rooms101.com>
Date 2022-09-27 09:45

No, nothing yet. But I feel good about it and will fight it if they refuse to pay.  So go ahead as a good tour.

Cordially,
Linda Mayhugh, RRP / CMP
Chief Operating Officer
Gunn Marketing Group, Inc.
O:  727-286-3090 (Main)
O:  727-493-4530 (Direct)
C:  863-412-4904
linda@gunnmarketinggroup.com
Skype: linda.mayhugh84

On Tue, Sep 27, 2022 at 9:30 AM <michele@rooms101.com> wrote:

Linda,



Any confirm on this yet.  The client is threatening to do a chargeback?



Michele



On 2022-09-21 08:55, Linda Mayhugh wrote:

> Ok, I will.

> 

> Cordially,

> Linda Mayhugh, RRP / CMP

> Chief Operating Officer

> Gunn Marketing Group, Inc.

> O:  727-286-3090 (Main)

> O:  727-493-4530 (Direct)

> C:  863-412-4904

> linda@gunnmarketinggroup.com

> Skype: linda.mayhugh84

> 

> On Wed, Sep 21, 2022 at 12:52 PM <michele@rooms101.com> wrote:

> 

>> ok, Please let me know asap because we need to refund the client the

>> non

>> tour fee we charged her.

>> 

>> Thanks

>> Michele

>> 

>> On 2022-09-21 08:14, Linda Mayhugh wrote:

>>> Yes, that's what it looks like to me! We'll get it invoiced and

>> will

>>> need to get paid on it before we can pay you back and pay you for

>> the

>>> tour though since it's taken over a month to receive this dispute

>>> resolution, we need to make sure it's gonna go through.  I'll get

>> it

>>> invoiced this week.

>>> 

>>> Cordially,

>>> Linda Mayhugh, RRP / CMP

>>> Chief Operating Officer

>>> Gunn Marketing Group, Inc.

>>> O:  727-286-3090 (Main)

>>> O:  727-493-4530 (Direct)

>>> C:  863-412-4904

>>> linda@gunnmarketinggroup.com

>>> Skype: linda.mayhugh84

>>> 
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>>> On Wed, Sep 21, 2022 at 10:10 AM <michele@rooms101.com> wrote:

>>> 

>>>> This is the client that we went back and forth with the bought

>> with

>>>> Westgate.

>>>> 

>>>> We just received this attachment.  Does this mean that we are

>> being

>>>> paid

>>>> for the tour???

>>>> 

>>>> Michele
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