Re: AC-Flagship - 8/26/2022 Hodge, Tameka CANCEL

From Kimberly Green <kimgreenqualityvacations@gmail.com>
To Unknown <reservations@rooms101.com>
Date 29/08/2022 10:51

cost: $85

On Thu, Aug 25, 2022 at 1:15 PM <reservations@rooms101.com> wrote:
Kim,

| had Margo call the client as we never heard anything from them.
Cancel this reservation and let me know what the cost will be.

Thanks
Michele

0On 25/08/2022 07:13, Kimberly Green wrote:

> Did she call you?

> She emailed that she sent a cancelation letter. | didn't receive
> anything and she isn't canceled. Please advise.

>

> On Fri, Aug 19, 2022, 1:18 PM <reservations@rooms101.com> wrote:

>

>> Kim,
>>
>> Please send out the confirmation. tamekalhodge@gmail.com

>>

>> Thanks

>> Michele

>>

>>0n 01/07/2022 14:24, Kimberly Green wrote:
>>> Reservation #357552 Flagship

>>> Presentation #571616, on 8/27 at 1Tpm

>>>

>>>0n Thu, Jun 30, 2022 at 1:47 PM <reservations@rooms101.com> wrote:
>>>

>>>> Kim,

>>>>

>>>> Please book this reservation with Flagship Atlantic City.

>>>>

>>>> Thanks

>>>> Michele
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