
Re: 3/3/2023 - Dorler ,April 2 Bdroom cabin
From Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>
To <reservations@rooms101.com>
Date 11/08/2022 09:54

 ER-Dorler.pdf(~3 KB)

Here you go!


APRIL DORLER - RES# 97963 - ER 240 ( 2 BEDROOM CABIN) - TOTAL TO BE CHARGED = $397.00


1 more day 😩 lol


Thanks,

Adam


On Aug 11, 2022, at 1:45 PM, reservations@rooms101.com wrote:



﻿Adam,



Please book this cabin.



Thanks

Michele
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