Re: Payment on Invoice 205865

From Evelyn Guzman <guzmanej7@gmail.com>
To <howie@rooms101.com>
Date 2022-10-04 05:18

GM Sir,

Thank you for processing the payment of $280 yesterday. | resolved the issue on the other account. Apparently it was my short fall, | had not activated the
new card replacement. Please go ahead and process the payment for the amount of $122.14. If you have any questions please let me know.

Thanks,

Evelyn Gould
352.255.1354

On Mon, Oct 3, 2022, 12:56 PM <howie@rooms101.com> wrote:
You can pay anytime before the cancellation date. | look to see if there
were any open account to see about transfer the money and | can not find
any.

Customer Care

On 2022-09-29 07:06, Evelyn Guzman wrote:
> Ok, thank you.

>

>0n Thu, Sep 29, 2022 at 11:01 AM <howie@rooms1071.com> wrote:
>

>> The accounting department does not have WIFI do to the storm so they
>>

>> will be calling you back as soon as they can

>>

>> Customer Care

>>

>>0n 2022-09-28 10:34, Evelyn Guzman wrote:

>>> Can | make payments on this invoice at this time or do | have to

>> wait

>>> for the scheduled payments? | have credit balances on some of my
>>> accounts and would like to apply them to this vacation purchase.
>>> Please advise. | can be reached via this email or at

>> 352-255-1354.

>>>

>>> Thanks,

>>>

>>> Evelyn Gould




