Re: Cancellation of reservation

From <reservations@rooms101.com>
To marsha weldon <marshaweldon@yahoo.com>
Date 22/12/202207:53

Ms Weldon,

Thank you for your email. However,NO refund will be issued as the hotel did NOT waive the fee for you not traveling due to cold weather and
insufficient notice of cancellation as your agreed in the terms.

Happy Holiday.

On 21/12/2022 11:09, marsha weldon wrote:

I’ve canceled and closed that card out .

To return my funds call my bank directly ask for Peyton. First service
bank 501-679-7300

Or mail me my money next day delivery and send me a copy of tracking
number and information

Marsha Weldon

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone [1]

On Wednesday, December 21, 2022, 10:43 AM, reservations@rooms1@1.com

wrote:

We are letting you know that we are trying to get the cancellation
fees

waived with the hotel. It usually takes up 17-to 10 business days.

If you have any question pleas reply to this email.

Customer Care

Rooms101.com

[1] https://overview.mail.yahoo.com/?.src=i0S
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