RE: 640614-Crane-wants 4 nts

From Krystal Minivac <krystalminivac@kivc.com>
To <reservations@rooms101.com>
Date 29/11/2023 03:44

The 7th.

Monica Ross

Krystal Cancun Mini Vac Dept.

52-998-848-9800 ext 828

Paseo Kukulcan KM 9 Lotes 9y 9 A

Zona Hotelera, Cancun, Quintana Roo C.P. 77500

De: reservations@rooms101.com [mailto:reservations@rooms101.com]
Enviado el: martes, 28 de noviembre de 2023 12:26 p. m.

Para: Krystal Minivac
Asunto: Re: 640614-Crane-wants 4 nts

so what are the new night that mr crane is staying



On 28/11/2023 08:08, Krystal Minivac wrote:



No extra cost on our because the promos are for 4 nights, now from
7-11

Monica Ross

Krystal Cancun Mini Vac Dept.

52-998-848-9800 ext 828

Paseo Kukulcan KM 9 Lotes 9y 9 A

Zona Hotelera, Cancun, Quintana Roo C.P. 77500

De: reservations@rooms1@l.com [mailto:reservations@rooms101.com]
Enviado el: martes, 28 de noviembre de 2023 11:51 a. m.

Para: Krystal-Monica Ross

Asunto: Fwd: RE: 640614-Crane-wants 4 nts

I am confused what are the travel dates for mr crane and what is the
price now

thanks

-------- Original Message --------
Subject: RE: 640614-Crane-wants 4 nts
Date: 28/11/2023 07:23
From: "Krystal Minivac" <krystalminivac@kivc.com>

To: <reservations@rooms101.com>

Great all set.

Monica Ross

Krystal Cancun Mini Vac Dept.

52-998-848-9800 ext 828

Paseo Kukulcan KM 9 Lotes 9y 9 A

Zona Hotelera, Cancun, Quintana Roo C.P. 77500

De: reservations@rooms10l.com [mailto:reservations@rooms101.com]

Enviado el: martes, 28 de noviembre de 2023 11:18 a. m.
Para: Krystal Minivac
Asunto: Re: 640614-Crane-wants 4 nts

yes  agreed
On 27/11/2023 04:02, Krystal Minivac wrote:

Hello,

Just FYI, this Reservation is for 3 nights but the client called and
said it should be for 4 which is technically the minimum so she will
be arriving on the 7th until the 11th.

640614

08-feb-24

11-feb-24

Steven Crane

Monica Ross

Krystal Cancun Mini Vac Dept.

52-998-848-9800 ext 828
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Zona Hotelera, Cancun, Quintana Roo C.P. 77500




