Re: 4/28/2023 Handy, Felisha Cabin 302 - credit card charged!

From Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>

To <reservations@rooms101.com>

Cc <michele@rooms101.com>, Adam Lawson <adam.l@gotoepm.com>, <MBA@GOTOEPM.COM>
Date 28/04/2023 05:53

ER-Hardy.pdf(~3 KB)

Here you go!
FELISHA HANDY - RES# 112905 - ER 302 (2 BEDROOM CABIN) - ©4/28 FOR 2 NIGHTS - TOTAL CHARGED = $268.00

Thanks,

Adam Lawson

Reservations Manager

Eagle Property Management, Inc.
865-868-6028

Www.eaglesridge.com

Www.myheritagecabin.com

On Apr 28, 2023, at 9:36 AM, reservations@rooms10l1.com wrote:

Adam,

Please book this cabin. Margo said she already spoke with you about this.

Thanks
Michele



http://www.eaglesridge.com/
http://www.myheritagecabin.com/
mailto:reservations@rooms101.com

