
Re: 8/10/2023 Moyd, Shanita 5Bdr/game room
From orlando renters <bookings4orlando@gmail.com>
To <reservations@rooms101.com>
Date 03/05/2023 03:29

Hi

Confirmed at $1172

On Tue, May 2, 2023 at 9:13 AM <reservations@rooms101.com> wrote:
Good morning.

Please book this reservation and confirm our cost.

Thank you

Michele

--
Kind Regards

Orlando Renters
352 227 8145

disneyareaaccommodation.com

mailto:reservations@rooms101.com
http://disneyareaaccommodation.com/

