Re: Amanda Mayes (Cancun Trip)

From amayes26@aol.com <amayes26@aol.com>
To <reservations@rooms101.com>
Date 31/01/2024 13:40

My trip is already booked my final payment was due today but | wanted to pay it in 2/15.

On Wednesday, January 31, 2024 at 03:04:32 PM EST, <reservations@rooms101.com> wrote:
unfortunately that date is sold out

On 31/01/2024 10:52, amayes26@aol.com wrote:

> Hello,

>

> My final payment was due on today but | wanted to see if | can make it
> 2/15. My trip is not until May. Thanks for understanding.

>

> Thanks,

>

> Amanda Mayes



